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Anxiety and Panic Attacks

Testimonials:

Lainey: "About 2 years ago my sister died in her sleep after a long and stressful battle
with alcoholism and pill addiction. I literally went into a downward spiral to the point
where I truly thought I was dying. I developed both Panic Disorder and Anxiety
Disorder.

Last year, in an effort to lose some of the stress weight I had put on through all of
this, I joined the 12 week Mangosteen and Mineral Weight Loss Challenge. In the first
week I dropped 10 pounds and have been consistently losing weight since then! I have
noticed my hair and skin getting healthier and my nails are even growing like crazy!
But that's not even the best part! I found that the Mangosteen and Mineral product
really helped my anxiety and panic symptoms!

I encourage ANYBODY who suffers from Anxiety and/or Panic Attacks to use this
product! It has really given me my life back! I have full control over my mind again
and feel like I can achieve ANYTHING I PUT MY MIND TO!"

Lainey
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Arthritis

Testimonials:

Denise: "Earlier this year, I was having excruciating pain and needed a walker to help
me get around. I had x-rays taken and I was diagnosed with severe arthritis in my back
and hip.  My doctor put me on Neurontin (gabapentin) but, the side effects were so
terrible so I had to stop taking it.

Then my doctor prescribed Lyrica (pregabablin).  The side effects from that
medication were just as bad as the Neurontin so I had to stop taking that medication
too.

My friend suggested I start taking 2 ounces of the Mangosteen and Minerals product
with added Silica once a day.  She told me that the silica would help with the
production of collagen in my body. I started drinking this Mangosteen and Minerals
with Silica product every day.  In less than 2 weeks my pain went all the way down
from a level 10 to a level 3 on scale of 1-10!  The benefits I am experiencing from the
Mangosteen and Minerals with Silica also includes no side effects from medications. I
would hardly have believed that a completely all-natural product could have helped
me so much with pain relief if I had not experienced it for myself."

Denise

Joanne: "A while ago I developed severe pain in my right knee and thigh. My doctor
prescribed muscle relaxers, then Tramadol for pain. It was hard to walk, and
sometimes my leg would almost give out. It became increasingly worse. I was unable
to up the stairs normally, having to drag my right leg one step at a time. Even a curb
became a painful obstacle. I was put on Vicodin for pain, which did nothing except
make me drowsy. It was just awful. I had an ultrasound on my knee and an x-ray on
my lower back and thigh. The results showed arthritis in my hip. I was sent to a pain
management doctor since nothing was relieving my terrible pain. My doctor told me to
get OTC Glucosamine Chondroitin, and to get a cortisone injection. After the initial
Lanocaine wore off, the doctor said the cortisone shot would kick in, if it was going to
work. It didn’t. The pain came back and remained. I then started taking Ibuprofen,
800 mg. I still couldn’t go up and down steps normally. I dealt with the horrible pain
and inconvenience for a year. Then my daughter got me started on the Mangosteen
DQG�0LQHUDOV��$IWHU��ò�PRQWKV��,�GLVFRYHUHG�,�FRXOG�JR�XSVWDLUV�LQ�RXU�KRXVH�QRUPDOO\
again … and with NO pain! I stopped taking the Glucosamine pills. I cannot believe the
tremendous difference the Mangosteen and Minerals has made in my life!"

Joanne G. - Oceanside, CA

Lee Anne: “I have been taking the mangosteen and mineral product now for about 8
weeks. After 1 week, my rheumotoid arthritis was so much better in my knees, that I
didn’t need to takes steps 1 step at a time.”

Lee Ann - Missouri
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